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  POELLATH advises management of rehaneo 
GmbH on sale to Fremman Capital 

  

  Pan-European investment firm Fremman Capital (“Fremman”) has acquired a majority stake 
in rehaneo GmbH (“rehaneo”), a leading provider of outpatient rehabilitation, aftercare, pre-
vention and occupational health management in Germany. The seller is European investment 
company GIMV. Founders Bruno Crone (CEO) and co-founder Christoph Dühr (COO) will re-
main significantly involved in the company and continue in their existing roles. Together with 
Fremman, the management team at rehaneo will continue the proven growth strategy, further 
consolidate the fragmented sector and thus build a leading company in Europe. The transac-
tion closed on January 31. In connection with the sale, POELLATH provided comprehensive 
legal advice to the management of rehaneo regarding management participation.  

Munich-based rehaneo GmbH provides outpatient rehabilitation, rehabilitation aftercare, phys-
iotherapy and occupational therapy, as well as prevention and occupational health manage-
ment. Since its foundation, rehaneo has integrated 15 companies with a total of 27 locations 
into the group throughout Germany. The company’s goal is to further consolidate the care 
network and thus be able to offer even more people professional rehabilitation measures close 
to home. In addition to the group’s continuous growth and the expansion of its locations, the 
primary focus is on the quality of its services. rehaneo employs more than 1,300 people who 
care for over 100,000 patients annually.  

POELLATH provided comprehensive legal advice to the management of rehaneo on the man-
agement participation in relation to the sale with the following Munich-based team: 

 Dr. Benedikt Hohaus (partner, lead, management participation, M&A/PE) 
 Dr. Verena Stenzel (associated partner, M&A/PE) 

  

  About us 

POELLATH is a market-leading international business and tax law firm with more than 180 
lawyers and tax advisors in Germany. We stand for high-end advice on transactions and as-
set management. We offer legal and tax advice from one source. In our selected and highly 
specialized practice groups, we not only know the law, but shape the best practice in the mar-
ket together with our clients. National and international rankings regularly list our professionals 
as leading experts in their fields. 

  

https://fremman.com/
https://www.rehaneo.de/
https://www.gimv.com/de
https://www.pplaw.com/en/professionals/hohaus-benedikt
https://www.pplaw.com/en/professionals/stenzel-verena
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We offer comprehensive service in the following areas: Mergers & Acquisitions | Private Equity 
| Venture Capital | Private Funds | Real Estate | Corporate and Capital Markets | Finance | Tax 
| Private Clients | Foundations and Non-Profit Organizations | IP/IT, Distribution and Antitrust 
Law | Litigation and Arbitration. 

 


